
Purchasing Department  

1320 West Main Street Suite 202 

Franklin, Tennessee 37064-3700 

Phone (615) 472-4010 

 
To: Rachel Farmer  

From: Kirk Elliott  

Date: January 3, 2022  

RE: Purchasing Report 

 

Contains bid projects for the months of November and December 2021 

 

The following is a summary of pertinent bid data for inclusion with the Board Materials to be reviewed at 

the next meeting. The summary is an order of ascending bid sequence numbers and not necessarily by 

date. Pursuant to Board Policy, this summary reports recent RFB’s (Requests for Bids) and RFP’s 

(Requests for Proposals) that were administered by the WCS Purchasing Department. As always, any 

purchasing – bid project that may require Board action should appear on the Board Agenda. The projects 

listed below do not require Board action at the present time and are listed here for your information. If 

further details are needed, please contact the Purchasing Department to review any of the related bid – 

project files. In addition to the projects listed in this monthly report, the WCS Purchasing Department 

continues to review, approve, and process numerous daily purchase orders that encompass day-to-day 

operations as well as negotiate renewals of previously bid contracts. 

 

RFP #1262 Williamson County Schools Online Surplus Auctions - Part B 

Project 

Description 

WCS sold various used and worn surplus furniture and equipment items at the 

on-line auction…gross proceeds were approx. $12,000.  Note:  Prior to the 

auction, WCS donated a number of items, at no cost, to the Humphreys County 

School District to aid and assist in their recovery efforts. 

Department  Purchasing on-line auction 

Advertised Monday, October 25, 2021 in the Tennessean   

Bid Opening 

Beginning Sunday, November 14, 2021 thru Sunday, November 

21, 2021 at 5:00 p.m.   
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



Purchasing Department  

1320 West Main Street Suite 202 

Franklin, Tennessee 37064-3700 

Phone (615) 472-4010 

 
 

RFB #1265 Phase III Page High School Addition Construction Package 

Project Description 
This project solicited bids for the construction and renovation 

project at Page HS. 

Department/Director Facilities & Construction, Eric Gardner 

Architect/Engineer Chase Turpin, GMC   

Advertised 

Thursday, September 23, 2021 in the 

Tennessean   

Bid Opening Thursday, November 4, 2021 at 10:30 a.m. 

Bidders Solicited 

 for this Project  

Name of Company  Bid Amount 

American Constructors   

Baron Construction   

Bell and Associates   

Deangelis Diamond Construction   

Dowdle Construction   

Fellowship Construction   

Hardaway Construction   

Lee Adcock Construction   

Orion Building Corp.   

Pride Concerete   

R.C. Matthews   

R.G. Anderson $24,989,000.00  

Rock City Construction   

Romach   

Southland Constructors   

Wright Construction Services $29,220,000.00  

Awarded  R.G. Anderson 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



Purchasing Department  

1320 West Main Street Suite 202 

Franklin, Tennessee 37064-3700 

Phone (615) 472-4010 

 
 

RFB #1271 Bethesda Elementary School Wastewater Improvements 

Project 

Description 

This project was to perform wastewater improvements at Bethesda 

Elementary School. 

Department  Maintenance, Adam Christopher 

Architect/Engineer Steven Jones, Water Management Services   

Advertised Friday, October 8, 2021   

Bid Opening Thursday, November 18, 2021 at 2:30 p.m.   

  Name of Company Bid Amount 

Bidders Solicited 

for this Project 

Civil Constructors   

Contracting Services   

Dynamics, Inc.   

Gillespie Construction Enterprises   

J & H   

Mid State Construction Co   

Romach   

Roy Joe Angel Construction Co $1,850,000.00  

Underground Pipe & Construction   

W & O Construction Company $1,821,000.00 

Awarded  W & O Construction Company 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



Purchasing Department  

1320 West Main Street Suite 202 

Franklin, Tennessee 37064-3700 

Phone (615) 472-4010 

 
 

RFP #1272 AED Automated External Defibrillators 

Project 

Description Procurement of AED units for district. 

Department  Purchasing 

Advertised Wednesday, November 3, 2021   

Bid Opening 

Tuesday, November 30, 2021 at 10:30 

a.m.   

  Name of Company 

Bid Amount for AED 

Units 

Bidders Solicited 

for this Project 

One Beat Medical $1,150.00  

AEO Superstore $1,182.75  

Cintas $1,149.00  

Premedics no bid 

Heartland Stryker no bid 

School Health $1,274.66  

General Med Devices $1,099.00  

Rescue One Training $1,058.00  

Sterling Medical $1,389.00  

Awarded  Rescue One Training 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



Purchasing Department  
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RFB #1273 New General Ed & Special Ed School Bus  

Project Description This project is for the procurement of New General Ed & Special Ed Buses.  

This is for both replacement and any new growth that is needed.  

Department/Director Transportation, Jeff Fuller 

Advertised 
Friday, November 5, 2021in the 

Tennessean   

Bid Opening Thursday, December 9, 2021 at 10:30 a.m. 

Bidders Solicited 

 for this Project  

Name of Company  

      General Ed                             

Special Ed  

Cumberland International  

       No Bid                                   

$112,553.00 

Mid South Bus Center  

    $115,252.00 w/beltfrm            

$117,970.00 

Central States  

    $123,523.00 w beltfrm             

$136,381.00 

Awarded  
19 Gen Ed buses awarded to Mid State Bus Ctr.   4 Special Ed Buses 

awarded to Cumberland Intl. 

 

RFP #1274 CTE IT: Autonomous Robot 

Project 

Description 

Procure an autonomous robot to be used for numerous applications for the WCS 

CTE Department.  This includes teaching students real world programming and 

research with GUI/payloads. 

Department  CTE, Jeremy Qualls 

Advertised Friday, October 22, 2021   

Bid Opening Tuesday, November 9, 2021 at 2:30 p.m.   

  Name of Company Bid Amount 

Bidders Solicited 

for this Project 

Anybotics   

Boston Dynamics $76,000.00  

Fetch Robotics   

True-Tech   

Unitree   

Awarded  Boston Dynamics 



Purchasing Department  

1320 West Main Street Suite 202 
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RFP #1275 District Copy Paper 

Project 

Description 

This is a comprehensive large distribution of Copy Paper for all WCS Schools & 

WCS Ancillary Bldgs. 

Each location is delivered a large portion of copy paper and the provider 

delivers, stacks and handles the logistics.  This is the second paper distribution 

for this school year.     

Department  Purchasing 

Advertised  Wednesday, November 3, 2021 in the Tennessean   

Bid Opening Wednesday, December 1, 2021 at 2:30 p.m.   

Bidders Solicited 

for this Project 

Name of Company Bid Amount 

American Paper & Twine $34.90 per case  

Liberty Paper  No bid  

Staples  No bid  

Office Depot  $34.99 per case   

Veritiv  $40.15 per case  

Awarded  American Paper & Twine was awarded this distribution  

 


