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To: Rachel Farmer 
From: Kirk Elliott 
Date: September 1, 2021 
RE: Purchasing Report 

Contains bid projects conducted during the month of August 2021 
The following is a summary of pertinent bid data for inclusion with the Board Materials to be reviewed at the next 
WCBOE meeting. The summary is in order of ascending bid sequence numbers and not necessarily by date. 
Pursuant to Board Policy this summary reports recent RFB's (Request for Bids) and RFP's (Request for Proposals) 
that were administered by the WCS Purchasing Department. As always any purchasing - bid project that may 
require Board action should appear on the Board Agenda. The projects listed below do not require Board action at 
the present time and are listed here for your information. If further details are needed please contact the 
Purchasing Department to review any of the related bid - project files. In addition to the projects listed in this 
monthly report the WCS Purchasing Department continues to review, approve and process numerous daily 
purchase orders that encompass day to day operations as well as negotiate renewals of previously bid contracts. 

RFB #1249 Classroom Addition Ravenwood High School 
Project Description This project solicited bids for the construction of classroom addition at Ravenwood HS. 
Department/Director Facilities, Eric Gardner 
Architect/Engineer Jim Pettit, J + B Architects 
Advertised Wednesday, July 21, 2021 in the Tennessean 
Bid Opening Tuesday, August 24, 2021 at 2:30 p.m. 

Bidders Solicited 
for this Project 

Name of Company Bid Amount 
American Constructors $8,210,319.00 
Baron Construction $8,901,000.00 
Bell and Associates 
Deangelis Diamond Construction 
Dowdle Construction $8,080,500.00 
Fellowship Construction $8,407,000.00 
Hardaway Construction 
Lee Adcock Construction $8,997,888.00 
Orion Building Corp. 
Pride Concerete 
R.C. Matthews 
R.G. Anderson $8,052,000.00 
Rock City Construction 
Romach $7,987,000.00 
Southland Constructors 
Wright Construction Services $8,821,000.00 

Awarded Full funding is not yet available. However, the intent is to award this project to 
Romach. 
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RFB #1253 District Vehicles 

Project Description This project consisted of soliciting bids from various vehicle dealers for the purchase of 
growth and replacement vehicles for the district departments. 

Department/Director Maintenance, Adam Christopher 
Advertised Monday, July 12, 2021 in the Tennessean 
Bid Opening Tuesday, August 3, 2021 at 10:30 a.m. 

Name of Company Bid Amount

Bidders Solicited 
for this Project 

                                              Item I  Item II     Item III      Item IV      Item V 
Freeland Chevrolet  $47,250.00      No Bid  No Bid        $31,505.00 $21,884.00 
Mid Tenn Ford $45,347.52   No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 
Neely Coble Company  No Bid  $63,208.00 $70,863.00         No Bid  No Bid 

Awarded Freeland, Mid Tenn & Neely Coble 

RFP #1256 Two-Way Radios 
Project Description This project was to purchase 2-way radios for schools and other WCS departments. 
Department Purchasing 
Advertised August 3, 2021 in the Tennessean 
Bid Opening Wednesday, August 25, 2021 at 2:30 p.m. 

Name of Company Bid Amount 
Kenwood Motorola Hytera 

Bidders Solicited Comm Tech $284.50 No Bid $299.30 
for this Project Middle Tennessee Two Way $295.50 $374.25 $294.80 

Mobile Communications No Bid $320.00 No Bid 
Nashville Comm No Bid $225.00 No Bid 

Awarded 
Comm Tech - Kenwood 
Middle Tennessee Two Way - Hytera 
Nashville Comm - Motorola 

QB #1258 Diesel Bus Engine Replacement 

Project Description 
This quick bid project is for a NEW OEM ENGINE - Complete engine replacement with 
old core exchange. No labor charge as this bid cost is for WCS Transportation personnel 
to perform installation. 

Department/Director Transportation, Jeff Fuller 
Bid Opening Wednesday, August 4, 2021 at 10:30 a.m. 

Name of Company Bid Amount 
Central States Bus Cumberland Int 
Clarke Power Services 
Cumberland International 

Bidders Solicited Dixie Diesel $19,828.24 
for this Project Jasper Engines 

MHC Kenworth 
Mid-South Bus Center 
Rush Truck Centers of Nashville 
Thompson Machinery 

Awarded Dixie Diesel 




